1HHEM

ITEM DESCRIPTION
Birchwood Airport Signal Crossing
System

qQry:

1

Fairview Loop Signal Crossing System 1

Total Base Bid LS

Birchwood Crossing System w/
Okonite DF Cable

Fairview Loop Crossing System w/
Okonite DF Cable

Total Additive Alternates Bid LS

ITB #21-10-208879

Signal Crossing System Design Assembly

Siemens Mobility,
Inc.

Extended Price

S 141,592.76

05/05/2021

Progress Rail
Services

Modern Railway
Systems

Extended Price Extended Price

Xorail, Inc.

Extended Price

178,645.60 S 201,319.00 $ 224,333.00
S 128,190.51 142,645.88 S 200,997.00 S 213,468.00
$  269,783.27 321,291.48 $  402,316.00 $  437,801.00
No bid No bid No bid S 296,821.00
No bid No bid No bid S 276,826.00
s . - $ - $  573,647.00
|_|_ 30.:.- Digitally signed by
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