
Department of Commerce, Community, 
and Economic Development 
ALCOHOL & MARIJUANA CONTROL OFFICE 

550 West 7th Avenue, Suite 1600 
Anchorage, AK 99501 

Main: 907.269.0350

February 15, 2023 

Odom Corporation
 6300 Changepoint Dr 
Anchorage, AK 99518
via email:  generalaccounting@odomcorp.com; jacob.hewitt@odomcorp.com 

License Number: 5118 

License Type: Package Store 
Transferor: Pete and Eva Foudeas 
Transferor Doing 
Business As: 

36th Ave. Liquor 

☒ Transfer of Ownership Application ☐ Transfer of Controlling Interest

AS 04.11.360(4) requires that the board deny an application for transfer of a license to another person if 
the transferor has not paid all debts or taxes arising from the conduct of the business licensed under this 
title unless the transferor gives security for the payment of the debts or taxes satisfactory to the creditor 
or taxing authority. Our records indicate that you are listed as a creditor or taxing authority for the 
above license.  

We have received an application for transfer of ownership for the above liquor license. For the purposes 
of AS 04.11.360(4) and in compliance with AS 04.11.280(b), this letter serves to provide written notice 
and request for status from the above referenced entity regarding the above application (see attached 
application documents for more information).  
Please complete and return this form to the AMCO office at alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.  

NAME: ____________________________________ PHONE:  ________________________ 

Do you have an objection to the transfer of this license?   Yes  No

AMOUNT OWED:  $7,694.11 DATE: ________________________  

COMMENTS: __________________________________________________________________________ 

If you have any questions, please send them to alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov. 

Sincerely, 

Joan Wilson 
Director, ABC Board 

425-456-3582Russell Fennell

$0 2-24-2023

ACH Payments received 2/17/2023, 2/21/2023 

AMCO Received  2/24/2023

mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov


CAUTION: This email originated from outside the State of Alaska mail system. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content
is safe.

From: Russell Fennell
To: Alcohol Licensing, CED ABC (CED sponsored)
Cc: General Accounting; Jan Weatherbee; Jacob Hewitt
Subject: RE: #5118 Creditors Notice for Alcohol Transfer Application
Date: Friday, February 24, 2023 8:14:38 AM
Attachments: #5118 AB-11.pdf

#5118 Creditor Notice-ODOM-02232023.pdf

Payment in full has been received. Updated creditor notice form attached.
 
Thank you,
 
 

 
Russell Fennell
Assistant Credit Manager
The Odom Corporation
11400 SE 8th St, Suite 300
Bellevue, WA  98004
425-456-3582 phone
800-767-6366 x1 then x2
425-233-0136 cell
russell.fennell@odomcorp.com
 
Shared Service Provider for Southern Glazer’s Wine & Spirits of the Pacific Northwest, LLC
 

From: Russell Fennell 
Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 1:04 PM
To: Alcohol Licensing, CED ABC (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov>
Cc: General Accounting <GeneralAccounting@odomcorp.com>; Jan Weatherbee
<Jan.Weatherbee@OdomCorp.Com>; Jacob Hewitt <Jacob.Hewitt@OdomCorp.Com>
Subject: RE: #5118 Creditors Notice for Alcohol Transfer Application
 
Hello AMCO,
 
I have updated the creditor notice attached with our objection to this transfer of license number
5118 - 36th Ave. Liquor. I have updated the amount owed to reflect the current account balance as
of 2-16-2023 and included updated statements. This balance has been communicated to Pete and
Eva Foudeas, but payment has not been received at this time.
 
 

 

mailto:Russell.Fennell@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:GeneralAccounting@odomcorp.com
mailto:Jan.Weatherbee@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:Jacob.Hewitt@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:russell.fennell@odomcorp.com












Department of Commerce, Community, 
and Economic Development 
ALCOHOL & MARIJUANA CONTROL OFFICE 


550 West 7th Avenue, Suite 1600 
Anchorage, AK 99501 


Main: 907.269.0350


February 15, 2023 


Odom Corporation
 6300 Changepoint Dr 
Anchorage, AK 99518
via email:  generalaccounting@odomcorp.com; jacob.hewitt@odomcorp.com 


License Number: 5118 


License Type: Package Store 
Transferor: Pete and Eva Foudeas 
Transferor Doing 
Business As: 


36th Ave. Liquor 


☒ Transfer of Ownership Application ☐ Transfer of Controlling Interest


AS 04.11.360(4) requires that the board deny an application for transfer of a license to another person if 
the transferor has not paid all debts or taxes arising from the conduct of the business licensed under this 
title unless the transferor gives security for the payment of the debts or taxes satisfactory to the creditor 
or taxing authority. Our records indicate that you are listed as a creditor or taxing authority for the 
above license.  


We have received an application for transfer of ownership for the above liquor license. For the purposes 
of AS 04.11.360(4) and in compliance with AS 04.11.280(b), this letter serves to provide written notice 
and request for status from the above referenced entity regarding the above application (see attached 
application documents for more information).  
Please complete and return this form to the AMCO office at alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.  


NAME: ____________________________________ PHONE:  ________________________ 


Do you have an objection to the transfer of this license?   Yes  No


AMOUNT OWED:  $7,694.11 DATE: ________________________  


COMMENTS: __________________________________________________________________________ 


If you have any questions, please send them to alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov. 


Sincerely, 


Joan Wilson 
Director, ABC Board 


425-456-3582Russell Fennell


$0 2-24-2023


ACH Payments received 2/17/2023, 2/21/2023 



mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov

mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov



		If you have any questions, please send them to alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.





Russell Fennell
Assistant Credit Manager
The Odom Corporation
11400 SE 8th St, Suite 300
Bellevue, WA  98004
425-456-3582 phone
800-767-6366 x1 then x2
425-233-0136 cell
russell.fennell@odomcorp.com
 
Shared Service Provider for Southern Glazer’s Wine & Spirits of the Pacific Northwest, LLC
 

From: Jacob Hewitt <Jacob.Hewitt@OdomCorp.Com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 12:59 PM
To: Alcohol Licensing, CED ABC (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov>; Jan Weatherbee
<Jan.Weatherbee@OdomCorp.Com>; Russell Fennell <Russell.Fennell@OdomCorp.Com>
Cc: General Accounting <GeneralAccounting@odomcorp.com>
Subject: RE: #5118 Creditors Notice for Alcohol Transfer Application
 
Hi Jan and Russell,
 
Per the attached, may A/R sign off on the transfer of AMCO customer license #5118 for Pete and Eva

Foudeas dba 36th Ave. Liquor regarding a $7,694.11 balance?
 
Thank you,
 

  
Jacob Hewitt
Senior Accountant
The Odom Corporation
11400 SE 8th St, Suite 300
Bellevue, WA 98004
425-467-7954 phone
425-468-4742 fax
Jacob.Hewitt@odomcorp.com
www.odomcorp.com
 

From: Alcohol Licensing, CED ABC (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 10:46 AM
To: General Accounting <GeneralAccounting@odomcorp.com>; Jacob Hewitt
<Jacob.Hewitt@OdomCorp.Com>
Cc: Alcohol Licensing, CED ABC (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov>
Subject: #5118 Creditors Notice for Alcohol Transfer Application
 
EXTERNAL EMAIL: Use caution with links and attachments.
 

Good morning,

mailto:russell.fennell@odomcorp.com
mailto:Jacob.Hewitt@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:Jan.Weatherbee@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:Russell.Fennell@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:GeneralAccounting@odomcorp.com
mailto:Jacob.Hewitt@odomcorp.com
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.odomcorp.com%2F&data=05%7C01%7Calcohol.licensing%40alaska.gov%7Ca9d1c7d4b4d946bfd8b208db168a86f8%7C20030bf67ad942f7927359ea83fcfa38%7C0%7C0%7C638128556773770099%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=%2B5ldxkYFaMe82Hxm0tIsXlPL%2FPk%2Fm4XuWs7bn6VucEE%3D&reserved=0
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:GeneralAccounting@odomcorp.com
mailto:Jacob.Hewitt@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov


 

I have attached the creditors notice for license #5118 dba 36th Ave Liquor. 
Please review the AB-11 form also attached and send back your response.
 
Thank you,
 
Kristina Serezhenkov
Licensing Examiner
Alcohol and Marijuana Control Office

550 West 7th Avenue, Suite 1600
Anchorage, Alaska 99501
 



Department of Commerce, Community, 
and Economic Development 
ALCOHOL & MARIJUANA CONTROL OFFICE 

550 West 7th Avenue, Suite 1600 
Anchorage, AK 99501 

Main: 907.269.0350 

MEMORANDUM 

TO: Alcoholic Beverage Control Board DATE: February 16, 2023 

FROM: Kristina Serezhenkov, OLE RE: #5118 dba Allocated 

Requested 
Action: 

Statutory 
Authority: 

Staff Rec.: 

Transfer Application 

AS 04.06.090(b): “The board shall review all applications for licenses made under 
this title and may order the director to issue, renew, revoke, transfer, or suspend 
licenses and permits authorized under this title.” 

AS 04.11.470: “A person may object to an application for issuance, renewal, transfer 
of location, or transfer to another person of a license, or for issuance of a permit, by 
serving upon the applicant and the board the reasons for the objection. The board 
shall consider the objections and testimony received at a hearing conducted under 
AS 04.11.510(b)(2) when it considers the application…” 

AS 04.11.510(b)(2): “The board may review an application for the issuance, renewal, 
transfer of location, or transfer to another person of a license without affording the 
applicant notice or hearing, except…(2) the board may, on its own initiative or in 
response to an objection or protest, hold a hearing to ascertain the reaction of the 
public or a local governing body to an application if a hearing is not required under 
this subsection;” 

Hold a public hearing; consider the transfer application along with the objection by 
creditor Odom.

Background:  This is a transfer of ownership from Pete and Eva Foudeas to Allocated LLC.   The 
response from the Municipality of Anchorage is still pending.  An objection was received on 
February 16, 2023 from creditor Odom.

Attachment:     Odom objection notice and updated billing statement of amount owed.
AB-01 
AB-02 



Department of Commerce, Community, 
and Economic Development 
ALCOHOL & MARIJUANA CONTROL OFFICE 

550 West 7th Avenue, Suite 1600 
Anchorage, AK 99501 

Main: 907.269.0350

February 15, 2023 

Odom Corporation
 6300 Changepoint Dr 
Anchorage, AK 99518
via email:  generalaccounting@odomcorp.com; jacob.hewitt@odomcorp.com 

License Number: 5118 

License Type: Package Store 
Transferor: Pete and Eva Foudeas 
Transferor Doing 
Business As: 

36th Ave. Liquor 

☒ Transfer of Ownership Application ☐ Transfer of Controlling Interest

AS 04.11.360(4) requires that the board deny an application for transfer of a license to another person if 
the transferor has not paid all debts or taxes arising from the conduct of the business licensed under this 
title unless the transferor gives security for the payment of the debts or taxes satisfactory to the creditor 
or taxing authority. Our records indicate that you are listed as a creditor or taxing authority for the 
above license.  

We have received an application for transfer of ownership for the above liquor license. For the purposes 
of AS 04.11.360(4) and in compliance with AS 04.11.280(b), this letter serves to provide written notice 
and request for status from the above referenced entity regarding the above application (see attached 
application documents for more information).  
Please complete and return this form to the AMCO office at alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.  

NAME: ____________________________________ PHONE:  ________________________ 

Do you have an objection to the transfer of this license?   Yes  No 

AMOUNT OWED:  $7,694.11 DATE: ________________________    

COMMENTS: __________________________________________________________________________ 

If you have any questions, please send them to alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.  

Sincerely, 

Joan Wilson 
Director, ABC Board 

Russell Fennell 425-456-3582 

$6,201.25 2-16-2023

Outstanding AR balance for deliveries 12-1-22 through 2-2-22

AMCO Received 2/16/2023

mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov


CAUTION: This email originated from outside the State of Alaska mail system. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content
is safe.

From: Russell Fennell
To: Alcohol Licensing, CED ABC (CED sponsored)
Cc: General Accounting; Jan Weatherbee; Jacob Hewitt
Subject: RE: #5118 Creditors Notice for Alcohol Transfer Application
Date: Thursday, February 16, 2023 12:05:14 PM
Attachments: #5118 AB-11.pdf

#5118 Creditor Notice-ODOM-021623.pdf
ccbak-stmt-021623.pdf
odom-stmt-021623.pdf
sgws-stmt-021623.pdf

Hello AMCO,
 
I have updated the creditor notice attached with our objection to this transfer of license number
5118 - 36th Ave. Liquor. I have updated the amount owed to reflect the current account balance as
of 2-16-2023 and included updated statements. This balance has been communicated to Pete and
Eva Foudeas, but payment has not been received at this time.
 
 

 
Russell Fennell
Assistant Credit Manager
The Odom Corporation
11400 SE 8th St, Suite 300
Bellevue, WA  98004
425-456-3582 phone
800-767-6366 x1 then x2
425-233-0136 cell
russell.fennell@odomcorp.com
 
Shared Service Provider for Southern Glazer’s Wine & Spirits of the Pacific Northwest, LLC
 

From: Jacob Hewitt <Jacob.Hewitt@OdomCorp.Com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 12:59 PM
To: Alcohol Licensing, CED ABC (CED sponsored) <alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov>; Jan Weatherbee
<Jan.Weatherbee@OdomCorp.Com>; Russell Fennell <Russell.Fennell@OdomCorp.Com>
Cc: General Accounting <GeneralAccounting@odomcorp.com>
Subject: RE: #5118 Creditors Notice for Alcohol Transfer Application
 
Hi Jan and Russell,
 
Per the attached, may A/R sign off on the transfer of AMCO customer license #5118 for Pete and Eva

Foudeas dba 36th Ave. Liquor regarding a $7,694.11 balance?
 
Thank you,

mailto:Russell.Fennell@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov
mailto:GeneralAccounting@odomcorp.com
mailto:Jan.Weatherbee@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:Jacob.Hewitt@OdomCorp.Com
mailto:russell.fennell@odomcorp.com












Department of Commerce, Community, 
and Economic Development 
ALCOHOL & MARIJUANA CONTROL OFFICE 


550 West 7th Avenue, Suite 1600 
Anchorage, AK 99501 


Main: 907.269.0350


February 15, 2023 


Odom Corporation
 6300 Changepoint Dr 
Anchorage, AK 99518
via email:  generalaccounting@odomcorp.com; jacob.hewitt@odomcorp.com 


License Number: 5118 


License Type: Package Store 
Transferor: Pete and Eva Foudeas 
Transferor Doing 
Business As: 


36th Ave. Liquor 


☒ Transfer of Ownership Application ☐ Transfer of Controlling Interest


AS 04.11.360(4) requires that the board deny an application for transfer of a license to another person if 
the transferor has not paid all debts or taxes arising from the conduct of the business licensed under this 
title unless the transferor gives security for the payment of the debts or taxes satisfactory to the creditor 
or taxing authority. Our records indicate that you are listed as a creditor or taxing authority for the 
above license.  


We have received an application for transfer of ownership for the above liquor license. For the purposes 
of AS 04.11.360(4) and in compliance with AS 04.11.280(b), this letter serves to provide written notice 
and request for status from the above referenced entity regarding the above application (see attached 
application documents for more information).  
Please complete and return this form to the AMCO office at alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.  


NAME: ____________________________________ PHONE:  ________________________ 


Do you have an objection to the transfer of this license?   Yes  No 


AMOUNT OWED:  $7,694.11 DATE: ________________________    


COMMENTS: __________________________________________________________________________ 


If you have any questions, please send them to alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.  


Sincerely, 


Joan Wilson 
Director, ABC Board 


Russell Fennell 425-456-3582 


$6,201.25 2-16-2023


Outstanding AR balance for deliveries 12-1-22 through 2-2-22



mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov

mailto:alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov



		If you have any questions, please send them to alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.






Date Document Age Charged Applied Balance


Return This Portion with Payment


P.O. BOX 84643


36TH AVE LIQUOR


36TH AVE LIQUOR


99503AKANCHORAGEANCHORAGE AK 99503


1207 W 36TH AVE, STE A


DELIVERY ADDRESS


98124-5943WASEATTLE


Coca-Cola Bottling of Alaska, LLC


REMITTANCE
AMOUNT


36TH AVE LIQUOR INC AKAMILANO'S INC


BILLING ADDRESS


STATEMENT DATE 2/16/2023


ACCOUNT # 16682


BALANCE $108.20


Billing Statement


1-800-767-6366 x1, x2


REMIT PAYMENTS TO:


01/05/2023 Order 14516692 42 ($45.44) $0.00 ($45.44)


01/05/2023 Order 14763834 42 $153.64 $0.00 $153.64


Please compare this statement with your records. Report any differences to our office immediately.


$0.00 $108.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $108.20


Current Over 30 Over 60 Over 90 Over120 Over150 Total








Date Document Age Charged Applied Balance


Return This Portion with Payment


P.O. BOX 84044


36TH AVE LIQUOR


36TH AVE LIQUOR


99503AKANCHORAGEANCHORAGE AK 99503


1207 W 36TH AVE, STE A


DELIVERY ADDRESS


98124-8444WASEATTLE


Odom Corporation


REMITTANCE
AMOUNT


36TH AVE LIQUOR INC AKAMILANO'S INC


BILLING ADDRESS


STATEMENT DATE 2/16/2023


ACCOUNT # 16682


BALANCE $3,182.67


Billing Statement


1-800-767-6366 x1, x2


REMIT PAYMENTS TO:


12/01/2022 Order 14640066 77 $611.65 $553.26 $58.39


12/08/2022 Order 14640105 70 $206.14 $0.00 $206.14


12/15/2022 Order 14640134 63 $398.05 $0.00 $398.05


12/22/2022 Order 14640163 56 $532.95 $0.00 $532.95


12/29/2022 Order 14640198 49 $440.80 $0.00 $440.80


12/29/2022 Order 14640199 49 ($33.74) $0.00 ($33.74)


01/05/2023 Order 14720225 42 $286.34 $0.00 $286.34


01/12/2023 Order 14720256 35 $267.59 $0.00 $267.59


01/19/2023 Order 14720288 28 $265.36 $0.00 $265.36


01/26/2023 Order 14720323 21 $460.23 $0.00 $460.23


01/26/2023 Order 14720324 21 ($17.25) $0.00 ($17.25)


02/02/2023 Order 14720356 14 $332.79 $0.00 $332.79


02/02/2023 Order 14720357 14 ($14.98) $0.00 ($14.98)


Please compare this statement with your records. Report any differences to our office immediately.


$1,026.15 $1,493.94 $662.58 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,182.67


Current Over 30 Over 60 Over 90 Over120 Over150 Total








Date Document Age Charged Applied Balance


Return This Portion with Payment


P.O. BOX 24663


36TH AVE LIQUOR


36TH AVE LIQUOR


99503AKANCHORAGEANCHORAGE AK 99503


1207 W 36TH AVE, STE A


DELIVERY ADDRESS


98124-0663WASEATTLE


Southern Glazer's Wine & Spirits


REMITTANCE
AMOUNT


36TH AVE LIQUOR INC AKAMILANO'S INC


BILLING ADDRESS


STATEMENT DATE 2/16/2023


ACCOUNT # 16682


BALANCE $2,910.38


Billing Statement


1-800-767-6366 x1, x2


REMIT PAYMENTS TO:


12/08/2022 Order 14573395 70 $533.40 $100.00 $433.40


12/15/2022 Order 14676026 63 $327.12 $0.00 $327.12


12/22/2022 Order 14676061 56 $96.54 $0.00 $96.54


12/29/2022 Order 14676095 49 $844.92 $0.00 $844.92


01/05/2023 Order 14676129 42 $612.36 $0.00 $612.36


01/26/2023 Order 14768028 21 $596.04 $0.00 $596.04


Please compare this statement with your records. Report any differences to our office immediately.


$596.04 $1,553.82 $760.52 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,910.38


Current Over 30 Over 60 Over 90 Over120 Over150 Total





krserezhenkov
Highlight



Date Document Age Charged Applied Balance

Return This Portion with Payment

P.O. BOX 84643

36TH AVE LIQUOR

36TH AVE LIQUOR

99503AKANCHORAGEANCHORAGE AK 99503

1207 W 36TH AVE, STE A

DELIVERY ADDRESS

98124-5943WASEATTLE

Coca-Cola Bottling of Alaska, LLC

REMITTANCE
AMOUNT

36TH AVE LIQUOR INC AKAMILANO'S INC

BILLING ADDRESS

STATEMENT DATE 2/16/2023

ACCOUNT # 16682

BALANCE $108.20

Billing Statement

1-800-767-6366 x1, x2

REMIT PAYMENTS TO:

01/05/2023 Order 14516692 42 ($45.44) $0.00 ($45.44)

01/05/2023 Order 14763834 42 $153.64 $0.00 $153.64

Please compare this statement with your records. Report any differences to our office immediately.

$0.00 $108.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $108.20

Current Over 30 Over 60 Over 90 Over120 Over150 Total

AMCO Received 2/16/2023



Date Document Age Charged Applied Balance

Return This Portion with Payment

P.O. BOX 84044

36TH AVE LIQUOR

36TH AVE LIQUOR

99503AKANCHORAGEANCHORAGE AK 99503

1207 W 36TH AVE, STE A

DELIVERY ADDRESS

98124-8444WASEATTLE

Odom Corporation

REMITTANCE
AMOUNT

36TH AVE LIQUOR INC AKAMILANO'S INC

BILLING ADDRESS

STATEMENT DATE 2/16/2023

ACCOUNT # 16682

BALANCE $3,182.67

Billing Statement

1-800-767-6366 x1, x2

REMIT PAYMENTS TO:

12/01/2022 Order 14640066 77 $611.65 $553.26 $58.39

12/08/2022 Order 14640105 70 $206.14 $0.00 $206.14

12/15/2022 Order 14640134 63 $398.05 $0.00 $398.05

12/22/2022 Order 14640163 56 $532.95 $0.00 $532.95

12/29/2022 Order 14640198 49 $440.80 $0.00 $440.80

12/29/2022 Order 14640199 49 ($33.74) $0.00 ($33.74)

01/05/2023 Order 14720225 42 $286.34 $0.00 $286.34

01/12/2023 Order 14720256 35 $267.59 $0.00 $267.59

01/19/2023 Order 14720288 28 $265.36 $0.00 $265.36

01/26/2023 Order 14720323 21 $460.23 $0.00 $460.23

01/26/2023 Order 14720324 21 ($17.25) $0.00 ($17.25)

02/02/2023 Order 14720356 14 $332.79 $0.00 $332.79

02/02/2023 Order 14720357 14 ($14.98) $0.00 ($14.98)

Please compare this statement with your records. Report any differences to our office immediately.

$1,026.15 $1,493.94 $662.58 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,182.67

Current Over 30 Over 60 Over 90 Over120 Over150 Total

AMCO Received 2/16/2023



Date Document Age Charged Applied Balance

Return This Portion with Payment

P.O. BOX 24663

36TH AVE LIQUOR

36TH AVE LIQUOR

99503AKANCHORAGEANCHORAGE AK 99503

1207 W 36TH AVE, STE A

DELIVERY ADDRESS

98124-0663WASEATTLE

Southern Glazer's Wine & Spirits

REMITTANCE
AMOUNT

36TH AVE LIQUOR INC AKAMILANO'S INC

BILLING ADDRESS

STATEMENT DATE 2/16/2023

ACCOUNT # 16682

BALANCE $2,910.38

Billing Statement

1-800-767-6366 x1, x2

REMIT PAYMENTS TO:

12/08/2022 Order 14573395 70 $533.40 $100.00 $433.40

12/15/2022 Order 14676026 63 $327.12 $0.00 $327.12

12/22/2022 Order 14676061 56 $96.54 $0.00 $96.54

12/29/2022 Order 14676095 49 $844.92 $0.00 $844.92

01/05/2023 Order 14676129 42 $612.36 $0.00 $612.36

01/26/2023 Order 14768028 21 $596.04 $0.00 $596.04

Please compare this statement with your records. Report any differences to our office immediately.

$596.04 $1,553.82 $760.52 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,910.38

Current Over 30 Over 60 Over 90 Over120 Over150 Total

AMCO Received 2/16/2023


























	#5118 Credtiors Objection and updated billing.pdf
	If you have any questions, please send them to alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.

	6758446.pdf
	If you have any questions, please send them to alcohol.licensing@alaska.gov.




