

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
TIMBER AUCTION RESULTS - JUNE 2024**

BOARD SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
103769		SALT AND PEPPER	Clallam	OLY	2417	\$828,000.00	\$1,167,600.00	\$483.08	41%	3.00	Western Timber, Inc.
104821		UPPER 5000	Clallam	OLY	5175	\$992,000.00	\$1,544,223.00	\$298.40	56%	2.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
104392		GHOST TOWN SORTS	Cowlitz	PC	5518	\$1,061,045.25	\$1,436,902.99	\$260.40	35%	2.29	See Sort Sales Results
103622	*	DEW DOG	Lewis	SP	4963	\$1,263,000.00	\$1,464,025.00	\$294.99	16%	4.00	Rainier Veneer, Inc.
106277		RICHMOND FIRE SALVAGE	Lewis	PC	3663	\$1,266,000.00	\$1,906,072.00	\$520.36	51%	7.00	Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
104686		SARUS	Skagit	NW	3616	\$1,015,000.00	\$1,430,291.13	\$395.55	41%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104444		RIDGE ENDER	Snohomish	NW	6602	\$1,805,000.00	\$2,501,016.92	\$378.83	39%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104695		FARM VIEW VRH SWT	Snohomish	NW	1868	\$375,000.00	\$579,854.32	\$310.41	55%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
105182		BEIGNET	Snohomish	NW	4562	\$1,702,000.00	\$2,561,091.77	\$561.40	50%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
105951		BOLOGNA	Snohomish	NW	3865	\$774,000.00	\$1,377,461.07	\$356.39	78%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
106090		Q RUFUS SORTS	Stevens, Pend Oreille	NE	6488	\$1,563,520.03	\$2,223,101.23	\$342.65	42%	1.88	See Sort Sales Results

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
June 2024	11	11	0	0	48,737	48,662	0	75	100%	\$12,590,593.28	\$18,191,639.43	\$373.84	44%	2.74
YTD FY 2024	89	89	0	0	371,710	371,147	0	563	102%	\$91,545,157.36	\$133,898,724.34	\$360.77	46%	3.13

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
106349		Q FLY BY NIGHT	Kittitas, Chelan	SE	3435	\$67,000.00	\$71,362.20	\$20.78	7%	1.00	Erickson Logging, Inc.
106233		LIBERTY	Klickitat	SE	1016	\$226,000.00	\$421,432.48	\$414.80	86%	6.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
June 2024	2	2	0	0	4,451	4,451	0	0	100%	\$293,000.00	\$492,794.68	\$110.72	68%	3.50
YTD FY 2024	15	14	0	1	29,215	28,901	0	314	99%	\$2,014,000.00	\$3,596,763.37	\$124.45	79%	2.50

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
June 2024	13	13	0	0	53,188	53,113	0	75	100%	\$12,883,593.28	\$18,684,434.11	\$351.79	45%	2.86
YTD FY 2024	104	103	0	1	400,925	400,048	0	877	99%	\$93,559,157.36	\$137,495,487.71	\$343.70	47%	3.05

June 2024

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)			# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF		
106329		GHOST TOWN SORT 1 DF 5"-11"	2,736	\$630.00	\$647.01	\$874,784.74	\$921,324.10	\$336.74	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
106330		GHOST TOWN SORT 2 DF 12"+	822	\$700.00	\$780.00	\$333,831.68	\$399,591.68	\$486.12	3	Sierra Pacific Industries
106331		GHOST TOWN SORT 3 RA 5"+, MA 8"+	735	\$315.00	\$567.00	(\$147,939.87)	\$37,280.13	\$50.72	2	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
106332		GHOST TOWN SORT 4 RC 5"+	3	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00	\$2,783.23	\$2,783.23	\$927.74	1	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
106333		GHOST TOWN SORT 5 WW 5"+	1,143	\$315.00	\$380.66	\$5,407.83	\$80,457.21	\$70.39	4	Sierra Pacific Industries
106333		GHOST TOWN SORT 5 WW 5"+	1,143	\$385.00		\$440,055.00			0	NO BIDS
106334		GHOST TOWN SORT 6 Conifer Pulp 2"+	56	\$325.00	\$325.00	(\$4,351.69)	(\$4,351.69)	(\$77.71)	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
106335		GHOST TOWN SORT 7 Hardwood Pulp 2"+	23	\$325.00	\$468.00	(\$3,470.67)	(\$181.67)	(\$7.90)	3	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC
106687		Q RUFUS SORT 01 DF/WL 7-10" dib	694	\$498.00	\$550.80	\$168,657.95	\$205,301.15	\$295.82	3	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
106688		Q RUFUS SORT 02 DF/WL 11"+ dib	633	\$530.00	\$535.00	\$187,363.56	\$190,528.56	\$300.99	2	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
106689		Q RUFUS SORT 03 AF/ES/GF/LP/WH/WP non-chuckabl	1,554	\$403.01	\$484.11	\$219,040.64	\$345,066.44	\$222.05	2	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
106690		Q RUFUS SORT 04 AF/ES/GF/LP/WH/WP non-chuckabl	1,176	\$461.04	\$461.57	\$162,363.04	\$162,986.24	\$138.59	1	IFG Timber, LLC
106691		Q RUFUS SORT 05 WRC Poles 35'+	220	\$1,201.20	\$1,716.00	\$206,354.72	\$319,610.72	\$1,452.78	2	Stella-Jones Corporation
106692		Q RUFUS SORT 06 WL Poles 35'+	75	\$719.63		\$53,972.00			0	NO BIDS
106693		Q RUFUS SORT 07 WRC 5"+ dib	680	\$902.00	\$1,540.00	\$468,405.07	\$902,245.07	\$1,326.83	3	Columbia Cedar, Inc.
106694		Q RUFUS SORT 08 DF/WL/AF/ES/GF/LP/WH/WP 5-6"	1,221	\$352.03	\$352.03	\$101,237.50	\$101,237.50	\$82.91	1	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
106695		Q RUFUS SORT 09 All conifer species except WRC 2"+ u	235	\$225.00	\$225.00	(\$3,874.45)	(\$3,874.45)	(\$16.49)	1	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.