

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

**October 2021**

AGREEMENT FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
100655	SOLDUCKING	Clallam	OLY	4903	\$1,042,000.00					NO BIDS
101293	ABOUT TIME	Grays Harbor	PC	4140	\$1,498,000.00					NO BIDS
102022	SHALE CREEK	Jefferson	OLY	5409	\$1,578,000.00					NO BIDS
97374	CROWN VRH & VDT King		SP	4900	\$1,863,000.00	\$2,333,138.00	\$476.15	25%	4.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
101209	SMOKED SALMON	Pacific	PC	2378	\$825,000.00	\$1,004,315.85	\$422.34	22%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101479	OXBOW	Pacific	PC	6727	\$2,463,000.00	\$3,150,690.42	\$468.36	28%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101783	WONDERWALL	Skagit	NW	1431	\$485,000.00	\$755,579.96	\$528.01	56%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101612	Q BLANCHARD	Spokane	NE	6796	\$1,263,000.00	\$1,388,014.26	\$204.24	10%	1.00	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
97605	LONGMONT	Whatcom	NW	971	\$465,000.00	\$555,700.00	\$572.30	20%	6.00	Frank Harkness Trucking and Logging
101663	LOWER BLUE	Whatcom	NW	1583	\$635,000.00	\$833,831.00	\$526.74	31%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>October 2021</b>	10	7	0	3	39,238	24,786	0	14,452	63%	\$7,999,000.00	\$10,021,269.49	\$404.31	25%	3.14
<b>YTD FY 2022</b>	30	24	0	6	118,396	97,684	0	20,712	83%	\$31,708,833.19	\$40,455,334.86	\$414.14	28%	2.51

**REGIONAL SALE RESULTS**

**October 2021**

AGREEMENT FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
102778	SEKIU CEDAR	Clallam	OLY	16	\$5,500.00	\$38,212.00	\$2,388.25	595%	3.00	Premium Shingle LLC
101695	BIG HOLLOW SALVAGE	Skamania	PC	1874	\$99,000.00					NO BIDS
101463	Q COYOTE BAR	Yakima	SE	1380	\$96,000.00	\$195,742.30	\$141.84	104%	4.00	Woodgrain Lumber

**SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>October 2021</b>	3	2	0	1	3,270	1,396	0	1,874	43%	\$101,500.00	\$233,954.30	\$167.59	130%	3.50
<b>YTD FY 2022</b>	5	4	0	1	4,984	3,110	0	1,874	62%	\$248,500.00	\$393,215.05	\$126.44	58%	2.50

**SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>October 2021</b>	13	9	0	4	42,508	26,182	0	16,326	62%	\$8,100,500.00	\$10,255,223.79	\$391.69	27%	3.22
<b>YTD FY 2022</b>	35	28	0	7	123,380	100,794	0	22,586	82%	\$31,957,333.19	\$40,848,549.91	\$405.27	28%	2.51

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)