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WASTE CONNECTIONS OF WASHINGTON, INC. Cert No. 
d/b/a WASTE CONNECTIONS G-253 
9411 NE 94TH 
VANCOUVER, WA  98662 
 
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICE in Clark County, EXCLUDING the territory described as 
follows: Starting at the intersection of the east line of Section 10, T5N, R1E and the Clark-Cowlitz 
County Line (also the centerline of the Lewis River); thence south along said line extended to the 
southeast corner of Section 22, T5N, R1E; thence west along the south line of said section extended to the 
northwest corner of Section 28, T5N, R1E; thence south along the west line of said section to the 
southwest corner of said section; thence west along the south line of Section 29, T5N, R1E extended to its 
intersection with the Clark-Cowlitz County Line; thence northerly and easterly along said county line to 
its intersection with the east line of Section 10, T5N, R1E, the point of beginning. 
 
EXCLUDING the City of Camas as of 9/13/1961. 
 
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICE in that portion of Cowlitz County described as follows: 
Starting at the intersection of the west line of Section 27, T6N, R3E and the Clark-Cowlitz County Line; 
thence north along said line extended to the northwest corner of Section 15, T6N, R3E; thence east along 
the north line of said section to the northwest corner of Section 13, T6N, R3E; thence north along the west 
line of said section extended to the northwest corner of Section 24, T7N, R3E; thence east along the north 
line of said section extended to its intersection with the Cowlitz-Skamania County Line (also the east line 
of Section 24, T7N, R4E); thence south along said county line to its intersection with the Clark-Cowlitz 
County Line (also the centerline of the Lewis River); thence westerly and southerly along said county line 
to its intersection with the west line of Section 27, T6N, R3E, the point of beginning. 
 
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICE in that portion of Skamania County described as follows: 
Starting at the southwest corner of Section 7, T5N, R5E; thence north along the west line of said section 
extended to the northwest corner of Section 19, T7N, R5E; thence east along the north line of said section 
extended to the northeast corner of Section 24, T7N, R6E; thence south along the east line of said section 
extended to the southeast corner of Section 12, T5N, R6E; thence west along the south line of said section 
extended to the southwest corner of Section 7, T5N, R5E, the point of beginning. 
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