




 

 

The survey on women’s life and well-being implements the project B.1.7 ‘Violence 
against women II: filling the data gap’ included in FRA’s Single Programming Document 
2023-2025. EIGE, as the co-controller of the data, has also included the project in their 
Single Programming Document 2023-2025 (‘under thematic priority ‘gender-based 
violence’). 
The purpose of the survey is to collect comparable data on women’s experiences of 
violence – including intimate partner violence as well as violence perpetrated by other 
people. The survey is largely based on the Eurostat-coordinated European survey on 
gender-based violence against women and other forms of inter-personal violence (EU- 
GBV) and the methodology proposed by Eurostat. The survey supports the efforts of the 
EU and its Member States to eradicate violence against women and support the victims. 
In a majority of EU Member States the national statistical authorities are implementing 
the EU-GBV survey – however, 8 Member States are not doing so nor do they have other 
sources that would provide comparable data. Therefore, FRA and EIGE are 
implementing the survey in these eight countries – namely, Cyprus, Czechia, Germany, 
Hungary, Ireland, Luxembourg, Romania and Sweden. 

The survey will process personal data for the purpose of organising the survey data 
collection – in three phases: the usability test, the pilot and the mainstage survey. In each 
of the three phases, the personal data that will be processed will include names, 
addresses, telephone numbers and email addresses that will be used to contact the 
people selected into the sample, schedule the interviews and, after the interviews, to 
administer the survey incentives and perform any necessary quality control checks. The 
survey interviews will collect information on women’s experiences, opinions and socio- 
demographic characteristics – however, these data will be stored separately from the 
personal data. The personal data will be kept only as long as it is necessary to carry out 
the data collection and quality control activities, and they will be destroyed at the end of 
the contract. Other survey data which doesn’t contain any personal details will be stored 
indefinitely for research purposes. 
The way respondents’ personal data will be collected and used – for the purpose of 
organising the interviews – depends on the data sources that are available in each 
country. With respect to data availability, the survey countries fall in three groups: 
1. Selection from a population register (Hungary, Luxembourg, Sweden). The fieldwork 
agencies in Hungary and Sweden to request from the population register a random 
sample of respondents. This includes people’s names and addresses, which are 
necessary for the interviewers to contact the respondents in person (in Hungary) or to 
mail the persons letters inviting them to complete the survey online (in Sweden). In 
Luxembourg, based on previous FRA surveys, the population register does not share 
people’s contact details, but the register draws the sample and mails the survey invitation 
letters (prepared by FRA, EIGE and Ipsos) to the selecting persons. The letters contain 
an individual link which allows Ipsos to monitor which letters have led to a completed 
survey as well as the cases where additional reminders should be sent. The population 
register in Luxembourg will then send the letters to the persons who have not already 
completed the survey, without sharing their personal data with FRA, EIGE or Ipsos. 
2. Address registry-based sampling (Czechia, Ireland). In these two countries, the survey 
does not have access to registers of individuals, but building registers are used instead. 
This involves drawing a sample of buildings, and sending interviewers to the selected 
addresses to determine how many households reside at the address. Randomly selected 
households are contacted to introduce the survey and to establish whether any eligible 
people (women aged 18-74 years) are currently living the household. Interviewers then 
collect the names of eligible women and perform a random selection to choose one 
respondent. In case the selected respondent is not at home or the interview needs to be 
postponed for another reason, interviewers keep the name of the selected participants 
















