

Service Date	Expense Type	Expense Description	Audit Quantity	Audit Unit Cost	Audit Total Cost
Attorney In Court					
7/27/2023	In Court	In Court- Jury Trial Day 4- Client takes Plea of [REDACTED]	4.2	50	210
7/26/2023	In Court	In Court Jury Trial Day 3- Testimony of Officer [REDACTED]	8	50	400
7/25/2023	In Court	In Court- Jury Trial Day 2- Opening Statements witnesses [REDACTED]	8	50	400
7/24/2023	In Court	Jury Trial Day One- Vor Dire [REDACTED]	8	50	400
7/21/2023	In Court	In Court- Motion to Prohi Alegatons of [REDACTED] taken under advisement- motion to dsmss denied, states motion for notice o...	2.8	50	140
7/6/2023	In Court	In Court- Reset	0.5	50	25
6/8/2023	In Court	Court appearance .3 reset	0.3	50	15
5/4/2023	In Court	appointed as counsel in court, motion to modify bond conditions	0.4	50	20
Attorney Out of Court					
7/26/2023	Out of Court Hours - Research & Review	reviewing 3 interviews of [REDACTED] that were provided in court earlier on 7-26-2023	4	50	200
7/22/2023	Out of Court Hours - Trial Preparation	preparing for trial, organizing files, last minute revisions of outline/vor dire and opening and closing- reviewing joshua shandles exce...	8	50	400
7/21/2023	Out of Court Hours - Interviews/Meetings	conf with DA .2, conf with client .3	0.5	50	25
7/21/2023	Out of Court Hours - Court Wait Time	court wait time	1.4	50	70
7/19/2023	Out of Court Hours - Correspondence	email with DA regarding attachments [REDACTED] documents training	0.2	50	10
7/19/2023	Out of Court Hours - Trial Preparation	Preparing for trial- working on trial exhibits, polishing outline, reviewing [REDACTED] parole file	8	50	400
7/18/2023	Out of Court Hours - Correspondence	email with DA with attachments of [REDACTED] CV and phone exhibits attached	0.3	50	15
7/18/2023	Out of Court Hours - Trial Preparation	review trial outline and new attachments phone exhibits prepare for trial	8	50	400
7/17/2023	Out of Court Hours - Trial Preparation	working on Vor Dire and Opening statements for trial	5.3	50	265
7/15/2023	Out of Court Hours - Interviews/Meetings	meeting with client, clients sister, clients brother in law and paralegal in prep for trial	6.1	50	305
7/14/2023	Out of Court Hours - Research & Review	listened to [REDACTED] interview and [REDACTED] interview in car recorded took notes and revised trial outline created with...	6.2	50	310
7/11/2023	Out of Court Hours - Trial Preparation	create witness files for [REDACTED] listen to jail calls 2.1, review [REDACTED] videos .5, Review client facebook ds...	6.4	50	320
7/10/2023	Out of Court Hours - Trial Preparation	reviewed drawing of crime scene and evidence logs compared to police folow ups looking for pill bottle, was it lost	8	50	400
7/8/2023	Out of Court Hours - Research & Review	reviewing TBI Forensic Firearms report, Latent Print Report, 1.1 Review videos of crime scene again 1.5 adding to trial outline 1.2, ...	7.2	50	360
7/7/2023	Out of Court Hours - Interviews/Meetings	meeting with client	5.2	50	260
7/6/2023	Out of Court Hours - Interviews/Meetings	conf with DA .3, conf with client .3,	0.6	50	30
7/6/2023	Out of Court Hours - Court Wait Time	court wait time	1.6	50	80

Claim Total [REDACTED]