
 Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 January 2022 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102019 OVER UNDER Clallam OLY 2889 $609,000.00 $1,067,127.00 $369.38 75% 3.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 101102 PROSPERO Grays Harbor SP 9066 $3,729,000.00 $4,451,150.88 $490.97 19% 1.00 Murphy Company 
 102026 ROLL WITH IT Jefferson OLY 2266 $663,000.00 $986,235.00 $435.23 49% 3.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 101297 AMERICAN  Lewis PC 4138 $1,296,000.00 $1,719,295.00 $415.49 33% 5.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 PHAROAH 
 101882 SECRET SQUIRREL Lewis PC 9540 $3,769,000.00 $5,226,583.00 $547.86 39% 4.00 Western Forest Products US LLC
 100607 SPECIAL  Pacific PC 6375 $1,906,000.00 $3,220,459.00 $505.17 69% 5.00 Western Timber, Inc. 
 CHARACTERS 
 100317 AMERICANA Skagit NW 2216 $646,000.00 $1,267,169.00 $571.83 96% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 102059 TWO YEARS OUT Wahkiakum PC 7716 $2,018,000.00 $2,028,630.87 $262.91 1% 1.00 Murphy Company 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2022 8 8 0 0 44,206 44,206 0 0 100% $14,636,000.00 $19,966,649.75 $451.67 36% 3.13 
YTD FY 2022 53 51 0 2 234,198 229,041 0 5,157 98% $75,565,024.99 $96,569,065.42 $421.62 28% 2.73 
  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102324 * THIRD CHANCE Mason SP 95 $37,000.00 $76,190.00 $802.00 106% 4.00 Manke Timber Company, Inc. 
 102865 Q RATTLESNAKE  Yakima SE 1660 $130,000.00 $153,247.75 $92.32 18% 1.00 Yakama Forest Products 
 FIRE SALVAGE 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2022 2 2 0 0 1,755 1,755 0 0 100% $167,000.00 $229,437.75 $130.73 37% 2.50 
YTD FY 2022 10 9 0 1 13,716 11,842 0 1,874 86% $777,210.00 $1,607,892.14 $135.78 107% 2.11 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2022 10 10 0 0 45,961 45,961 0 0 100% $14,803,000.00 $20,196,087.50 $439.42 36% 3.00 
YTD FY 2022 63 60 0 3 247,914 240,883 0 7,031 97% $76,342,234.99 $98,176,957.56 $407.57 29% 2.64 
 


