
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 March 2021 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100885 TOMAUDER Clallam OLY 1853 $316,000.00 $331,800.00 $179.06 5% 1.00 Bruch & Bruch Construction Inc. 
 100758 RIGHT MEOW Cowlitz PC 2116 $637,000.00 $710,262.00 $335.66 12% 3.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 99046 TIN MAN Grays Harbor SP 6675 $2,674,000.00 $2,798,326.06 $419.22 5% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 99242 SOLLEKS BOTTOM Jefferson OLY 8767 $1,423,000.00 $1,720,118.00 $196.20 21% 2.00 Harbor Timber 
 99245 NEXT LEVEL Jefferson OLY 4182 $559,000.00 $854,257.00 $204.27 53% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 101542 MAHI MAHI Jefferson OLY 8994 $1,957,000.00 $3,593,357.00 $399.53 84% 3.00 Harbor Timber 
 100091 OAKRIDGE Klickitat SE 2776 $1,088,000.00 $1,788,427.50 $644.25 64% 3.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 100177 MELANCHOLY Lewis PC 7105 $2,604,000.00 $3,213,661.00 $452.31 23% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99862 * TOP SPOT Mason SP 4572 $1,929,000.00 $2,819,134.00 $616.61 46% 4.00 Manke Timber Company, Inc. 
 101250 BIG FOX VRH Pacific, Wahkiakum PC 6150 $1,374,000.00 $1,757,990.91 $285.85 28% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 97606 LOBSTER VRH RMZ Whatcom NW 3646 $945,000.00 $1,019,257.00 $279.55 8% 2.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2021 11 11 0 0 56,836 56,836 0 0 100% $15,506,000.00 $20,606,590.47 $362.56 33% 2.55 
YTD FY 2021 85 83 0 2 426,719 413,340 0 13,379 97% $124,356,587.23 $169,009,761.00 $408.89 36% 2.50  

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2021 11 11 0 0 56,836 56,836 0 0 100% $15,506,000.00 $20,606,590.47 $362.56 33% 2.55 
YTD FY 2021 90 87 0 3 435,972 422,347 0 13,625 97% $124,922,587.23 $170,555,391.30 $403.83 37% 2.50 


