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General’s designee will act on the ap-
peal; 

(2) An adverse determination by the 
Attorney General will be the final ac-
tion of the Department; and 

(3) An appeal ordinarily will not be 
acted on if the request becomes a mat-
ter of litigation. 

(b) Responses to appeals. The decision 
on your appeal will be made in writing. 
A decision affirming an adverse deter-
mination in whole or in part will in-
clude a brief statement of the reason(s) 
for the affirmance, including any Pri-
vacy Act exemption applied, and will 
inform you of the Privacy Act provi-
sions for court review of the decision. 
If the adverse determination is re-
versed or modified on appeal in whole 
or in part, you will be notified in a 
written decision and your request will 
be reprocessed in accordance with that 
appeal decision. 

(c) When appeal is required. If you 
wish to seek review by a court of any 
adverse determination or denial of a 
request, you must first appeal it under 
this section. 

§ 16.46 Requests for amendment or 
correction of records. 

(a) How made and addressed. Unless 
the record is not subject to amendment 
or correction as stated in paragraph (f) 
of this section, you may make a re-
quest for amendment or correction of a 
Department of Justice record about 
yourself by writing directly to the De-
partment component that maintains 
the record, following the procedures in 
§ 16.41. Your request should identify 
each particular record in question, 
state the amendment or correction 
that you want, and state why you be-
lieve that the record is not accurate, 
relevant, timely, or complete. You may 
submit any documentation that you 
think would be helpful. If you believe 
that the same record is in more than 
one system of records, you should state 
that and address your request to each 
component that maintains a system of 
records containing the record. 

(b) Component responses. Within ten 
working days of receiving your request 
for amendment or correction of 
records, a component shall send you a 
written acknowledgment of its receipt 
of your request, and it shall promptly 

notify you whether your request is 
granted or denied. If the component 
grants your request in whole or in part, 
it shall describe the amendment or cor-
rection made and shall advise you of 
your right to obtain a copy of the cor-
rected or amended record, in 
disclosable form. If the component de-
nies your request in whole or in part, it 
shall send you a letter signed by the 
head of the component, or the compo-
nent head’s designee, that shall state: 

(1) The reason(s) for the denial; and 
(2) The procedure for appeal of the 

denial under paragraph (c) of this sec-
tion, including the name and business 
address of the official who will act on 
your appeal. 

(c) Appeals. You may appeal a denial 
of a request for amendment or correc-
tion to the Office of Information and 
Privacy in the same manner as a denial 
of a request for access to records (see 
§ 16.45) and the same procedures shall 
be followed. If your appeal is denied, 
you shall be advised of your right to 
file a Statement of Disagreement as 
described in paragraph (d) of this sec-
tion and of your right under the Pri-
vacy Act for court review of the deci-
sion. 

(d) Statements of Disagreement. If your 
appeal under this section is denied in 
whole or in part, you have the right to 
file a Statement of Disagreement that 
states your reason(s) for disagreeing 
with the Department’s denial of your 
request for amendment or correction. 
Statements of Disagreement must be 
concise, must clearly identify each 
part of any record that is disputed, and 
should be no longer than one typed 
page for each fact disputed. Your 
Statement of Disagreement must be 
sent to the component involved, which 
shall place it in the system of records 
in which the disputed record is main-
tained and shall mark the disputed 
record to indicate that a Statement of 
Disagreement has been filed and where 
in the system of records it may be 
found. 

(e) Notification of amendment/correction 
or disagreement. Within 30 working days 
of the amendment or correction of a 
record, the component that maintains 
the record shall notify all persons, or-
ganizations, or agencies to which it 
previously disclosed the record, if an 
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accounting of that disclosure was 
made, that the record has been amend-
ed or corrected. If an individual has 
filed a Statement of Disagreement, the 
component shall append a copy of it to 
the disputed record whenever the 
record is disclosed and may also append 
a concise statement of its reason(s) for 
denying the request to amend or cor-
rect the record. 

(f) Records not subject to amendment or 
correction. The following records are 
not subject to amendment or correc-
tion: 

(1) Transcripts of testimony given 
under oath or written statements made 
under oath; 

(2) Transcripts of grand jury pro-
ceedings, judicial proceedings, or 
quasi-judicial proceedings, which are 
the official record of those proceedings; 

(3) Presentence records that origi-
nated with the courts; and 

(4) Records in systems of records that 
have been exempted from amendment 
and correction under Privacy Act, 5 
U.S.C. 552a(j) or (k) by notice published 
in the FEDERAL REGISTER. 

§ 16.47 Requests for an accounting of 
record disclosures. 

(a) How made and addressed. Except 
where accountings of disclosures are 
not required to be kept (as stated in 
paragraph (b) of this section), you may 
make a request for an accounting of 
any disclosure that has been made by 
the Department to another person, or-
ganization, or agency of any record 
about you. This accounting contains 
the date, nature, and purpose of each 
disclosure, as well as the name and ad-
dress of the person, organization, or 
agency to which the disclosure was 
made. Your request for an accounting 
should identify each particular record 
in question and should be made by 
writing directly to the Department 
component that maintains the record, 
following the procedures in § 16.41. 

(b) Where accountings are not required. 
Components are not required to pro-
vide accountings to you where they re-
late to: 

(1) Disclosures for which accountings 
are not required to be kept—in other 
words, disclosures that are made to 
employees within the agency and dis-
closures that are made under the FOIA; 

(2) Disclosures made to law enforce-
ment agencies for authorized law en-
forcement activities in response to 
written requests from those law en-
forcement agencies specifying the law 
enforcement activities for which the 
disclosures are sought; or 

(3) Disclosures made from law en-
forcement systems of records that have 
been exempted from accounting re-
quirements. 

(c) Appeals. You may appeal a denial 
of a request for an accounting to the 
Office of Information and Privacy in 
the same manner as a denial of a re-
quest for access to records (see § 16.45) 
and the same procedures will be fol-
lowed. 

§ 16.48 Preservation of records. 
Each component will preserve all 

correspondence pertaining to the re-
quests that it receives under this sub-
part, as well as copies of all requested 
records, until disposition or destruc-
tion is authorized by title 44 of the 
United States Code or the National Ar-
chives and Records Administration’s 
General Records Schedule 14. Records 
will not be disposed of while they are 
the subject of a pending request, ap-
peal, or lawsuit under the Act. 

§ 16.49 Fees. 
Components shall charge fees for du-

plication of records under the Privacy 
Act in the same way in which they 
charge duplication fees under § 16.11. No 
search or review fee may be charged for 
any record unless the record has been 
exempted from access under Exemp-
tions (j)(2) or (k)(2) of the Privacy Act. 

§ 16.50 Notice of court-ordered and 
emergency disclosures. 

(a) Court-ordered disclosures. When a 
record pertaining to an individual is re-
quired to be disclosed by a court order, 
the component shall make reasonable 
efforts to provide notice of this to the 
individual. Notice shall be given within 
a reasonable time after the compo-
nent’s receipt of the order—except that 
in a case in which the order is not a 
matter of public record, the notice 
shall be given only after the order be-
comes public. This notice shall be 
mailed to the individual’s last known 
address and shall contain a copy of the 
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